
 
 

 

Wednesday, August 27, 2003 
 
Resident favors Bass Lake Park 
 
Wednesday, August 27, 2003 
 
 
I am a resident of a neighborhood surrounding the proposed Bass Lake Park. One of the reasons we chose the 
neighborhood was for the proposed park the realtors informed us about prior to our purchase.  
 
We moved in 18 months ago and I called the county and asked for a proposed 10-year plan for the development in my 
area (nearly three years ago). I was notified of the park as well as proposed schools and road changes. 
 
It was my understanding the current Bass Lake Road is to eventually become a secondary resident road. A new and 
straighter Bass Lake Road is planned to lead to Green Valley Road in between the high school and middle school.  
 
I don’t know how much of that plan has been changed, however, it seems that would take care of any problems leading to 
the new park. 
 
I do have concerns with a proposed elementary school on Bass Lake Road with the condition of the current road. Traffic is 
of a huge concern to many, including myself.  
 
In regard to the park and new school, I would recommend proposing anything that would address those concerns. 
 
I cannot, however, see a huge change in traffic to the park in regards to night field games as is proposed by the BLAC 
(Bass Lake Action Committee).  
 
I am currently on a softball team that plays at night at Lembi Park in Folsom and there is no rush of traffic to get there.  
 
They have the teams’ games and game times staggered in such a way that there is not a huge onset of traffic.  
 
The fields are lighted (night lighting, not stadium lighting) and once again due to the staggering of the games the first 
lights go out around 8:30 p.m. (one field) with the next set of lights (usually two fields) going out by 9:30 p.m. and a final 
field out by 10:30 p.m. 
 
I have played the late game and it is very quiet at the park.  
 
Bass Lake has proposed final lights out by 10 p.m., which is even better for surrounding neighbors.  
 
I think if Bass Lake does that type of staggering, it would minimize late night lights and noise. 
 
I would recommend anyone concerned about lighting and noise to visit a night game at Lembi Park (games resumed 
Monday).  
 
I can only see traffic as a major issue if the proposed amphitheatre is built with shows or music.  
 
I know that night lighting is also a major concern and if the theater was allowed to have evening performances, I would 
ask that the noise, traffic, and lighting be evaluated. A finish time and occupancy would need to be considered. 
 
It is my understanding, however, that this has been changed to a day use educational facility and those concerns should 
become null and void.  
 
It is no secret that Bass Lake Road is currently a dangerous road. It is unfortunate that plans to fix it have been delayed 
as safety should be the priority.  
 



I believe it is very important to fix the current problems in the road and any extra traffic, however large or small, whether 
generated by the park or not, warrants repair.  
 
I am surprised by the opposition. It almost appears they oppose it simply because they did not do their homework 
regarding the growth surrounding their neighborhood are now in a panic.  
 
The BLAC claims they are not opposed to the park, but I do not completely believe them. I have attended their meetings 
and appreciate the fact they are organizing them. I respect their opinion and they have their right to it, however I do not 
agree with delaying the needs of our children.  
 
My family and I are 150 percent in favor of the park and all that it will offer to our community.  
 
We believe the park will increase our property value. It will also offer a way of life to our children that they are accustomed 
to. I take my children to a park everyday in the Folsom, El Dorado Hills, Cameron park area.  
 
It would be ideal to have one in the immediate area as we currently have very few.  
 
-- KimVanhold 
 
hanks, Kim 
 
 
 
I am in favor of the park and its amenities. I feel if all safety concerns are addressed and solutions provided, then there is 
no need to halt or delay the first phase of construction. We have been waiting 18 months and look upon the park with 
anticipation and excitement.  
 
Thank you, Kim Vanhole 
 
 
 
I am a resident of a neighborhood surrounding the proposed Bass Lake Park.  
 
One of the reasons we chose the neighborhood was for the proposed park the realtors informed us about prior to our 
purchase.  
 
We moved in 18 months ago and I called the county and asked for a proposed 10-year plan for the development in my 
area (nearly 3 years ago). I was notified of the park as well as proposed schools and road changes.  
 
It was my understanding the current Bass Lake Road is to eventually become a secondary resident road. A new and 
straighter Bass Lake Road is planned to lead to Green Valley Road in between the high school and middle school. 
 
I don’t know how much of that plan has been changed, however it seems that would take care of any problems leading to 
the new park. I do have concerns with a proposed elementary school also on Bass Lake Road with the condition of the 
current road. Traffic is of a huge concern to many including myself, in regards to the park and new school and I would 
recommend proposing anything that would address those concerns. 
 
I cannot however see a huge change in traffic to the park in regards to night field games as is proposed by the BLAC 
(Bass Lake Action Committee).  
 
I am currently on a softball team that plays at night at Lembi Park in Folsom and there is no rush of traffic to get there. 
They have the teams’ games and game times staggered in such a way that there is not a huge onset of traffic. The fields 
are lighted (night lighting, not stadium lighting) and once again due to the staggering of the games the first lights go out 
around the 8:30pm hour (1 field) with the next set of lights (usually 2 fields) going out by 9:30pm and a final field out by 
10:30pm.  
 
I have played the late game and it is very quiet at the park. Bass Lake has proposed final lights to be out by 10 p.m., 
which is even better for surrounding neighbors.  
 
I think if Bass Lake does that type of staggering, it would minimize late night lights and noise. 
 
I would recommend anyone concerned about lighting and noise to visit a night game at Lembi Park (games resumed on 
Monday).  
 
I can only see traffic as a major issue if the proposed amphitheatre is built with shows or music.  
 



I know that night lighting is also a major concern and if the theater was allowed to have evening performances, I would 
ask the noise, traffic, and lighting be evaluated. A finish time and occupancy would need to be considered.  
 
It is my understanding however, that this has been changed to a day use educational facility and those concerns should 
become null and void.  
 
It is no secret that Bass Lake Road is currently a dangerous road. It is unfortunate that plans to fix it have been delayed 
as safety should be the priority.  
 
I believe it is very important to fix the current problems in the road and any extra traffic, however large or small, whether 
generated by the park or not, warrants repair.  
 
I am surprised by the opposition of the park by some. It almost appears they have chosen this opposition simply because 
they did not do their homework regarding the proposed park and growth surrounding their neighborhood are now in a 
panic because of their own negligence.  
 
The BLAC claims they are not opposed to the park, but I do not completely believe them. I have attended their meetings 
and appreciate the fact that they are organizing them. I respect their opinion and they have their right to it, however I do 
not agree with delaying the needs of our children.  
 
My family and I are 150 percent in favor of the park and all that it will offer to our community.  
 
We believe that the park will increase our property value. It will also offer a way of life to our children that they are 
accustomed to. I take my children to a park everyday in the Folsom, El Dorado Hills, Cameron park area. It would be ideal 
to have one in the immediate area as we currently have very few.  
 
I would also love to walk down the street rather than drive all the way to Folsom to play in my softball league.  
 
I am in favor of the park and its amenities. I feel if all safety concerns are addressed and solutions provided, then there is 
no need to halt or delay the first phase of construction.  
 
We have been waiting 18 months and look upon the park with anticipation and excitement.  
 
-- Kim Vanhole 
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